
$850,000 - 4891 Glen Eagle Drive, Fairmont Hot Springs
MLS® #10354621 

$850,000
4 Bedroom, 3.00 Bathroom, 2,770 sqft
Single Family on 0.45 Acres

N/A, Fairmont Hot Springs, British Columbia

Unparalleled Views & Exceptional Garage
Space â€“ A Rare Find in the Columbia Valley
Just one block from top-rated golf courses, the
Fairmont water park, and so much more, this
immaculately maintained bungalow offers a
unique blend of scenic beauty and functional
space. Set on a rare double lot, the property
boasts stunning Rocky Mountain views from
multiple vantage pointsâ€”including a
screened-in porch (retractable screens)
perfectly positioned to take in the morning light
and a covered west-facing deck ideal for
sunset watching. Car enthusiasts, hobbyists,
and outdoor adventurers will appreciate the
unmatched garage capacity: a three-car
garage, a separate two-car garage, and
dedicated RV parking. Whether you need
storage for vehicles, boats, or a full workshop
setup, this home delivers the space and
flexibility to meet your needs. Inside, the upper
level features a spacious and practical layout
with three bedrooms and a bright
open-concept living area. The fully finished
basement expands your living space to a full
2770 square feet with a large family room,
games room (complete with pool/ping pong
table included), a fourth bedroom, and a
3-piece bathroom. Thereâ€™s also an
oversized workshop and storage area that
could easily be converted into an additional
bedroom or studio. Tucked among mature
trees for privacy and peace, this
move-in-ready home is ideal as a full-time
residence or a mountain-view family getaway.



Donâ€™t miss this one-of-a-kind opportunity
to own space, scenery, and serenity in
Fairmont Hot Springs. (id:36535)

Built in 2003

Essential Information

Listing # 10354621

Price $850,000

Bedrooms 4

Bathrooms 3.00

Square Footage 2,770

Acres 0.45

Year Built 2003

Type Single Family

Sub-Type Strata

Style Bungalow

Community Information

Address 4891 Glen Eagle Drive

Subdivision N/A

City Fairmont Hot Springs

State British Columbia

Zip Code V0B1B0

Amenities

Amenities Golf Nearby, Airport, Recreation, Ski area

Features Level lot, Corner Site

Parking Spaces 10

Parking Attached Garage, Oversize, RV, See Remarks

# of Garages 5

View Mountain view

Interior

Heating Electric Baseboard heaters, Forced air

# of Stories 1

Exterior

Exterior Stucco



Exterior Features Landscaped, Level

Roof Material Metal

Roof Style Unknown

Additional Information

Zoning Unknown

Listing Details

Listing Office Courtesy Of DK Rice and RT Rice Of Royal LePage Rockies West
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